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10 H A S K I N S & S E L L S February 

COST figures serve a variety of pur­
poses. Primarily, perhaps, they 

constitute a basis for determining what the 
selling price should be in order to yield a 
satisfactory profit. Incidentally, they fur­
nish a measurement of effective operation 
and information which may lead to the 
checking of waste. Their greatest value 
probably consists in making past perform­
ance serve as a basis for future guidance. 

Just now there is much talk of reducing 
costs. British industry finds it the chief 
problem, we are told. But there is no 
reason why it should be the chief problem 
of Great Britain more than any other 
country largely engaged in manufacturing. 

Prices are high the world over. The 
great capital destroying event which began 
in August, 1914, may be indicted as the 
cause. It is inconceivable that the whole 
world should aid and abet, whether wil l­
ingly or otherwise, the casting of billions of 
dollars worth of the world's resources into 
a seething caldron of destruction without 
the resulting rise of prices. 

There were many fortunes made on the 
way up to the peak. Costs, less so than in 

normal times, except as they became the 
basis for government contracts, were fre­
quently ignored without damaging effect 
because free competition was put out of 
business by the abnormal conditions which 
prevailed. If ever the rule of "charge what 
the traffic wil l bear" enjoyed complete 
operation it was during the upward pull to 
February, 1920. 

But the inevitable has occurred. The 
peak has apparently been passed. The 
camel's back has been broken. The long-
suffering public has refused longer to be a 
party to the rampage of high prices. A 
buyer's strike has decreed that prices shall 
come down. 

The first step has taken place. Manu­
facturers, wholesalers, and retailers have 
courageously taken their losses. The 
workers, either through force of conditions 
or voluntarily, are arranging to stand their 
share, and education of the workers in at 
least one instance is responsible for a sane 
view of that group which led the members 
thereof to suggest a reduction in wages. 

But the end is not yet. Even though 
wholesale commodity prices have fallen 
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from 25 to 35 per cent., there is still a long 
stretch to the level of pre-war prices. 
Whether or not this level will again be 
reached is of course in question. The 
public hopes the decline wil l continue. 
Economists think that it wil l . It is, there­
fore, generally admitted that industry is 
heading into a period where costs will be 
more vital than ever before. The com­
petitive basis is being rapidly restored. 
Cost reduction will be an economic neces­
sity rather than the result of an economic 
incentive. 

Many associations of manufacturers are 
giving attention to uniform cost systems. 
Not long since, the International Associa­
tion of Garment Manufacturers arranged 
through its Cost Committee to prepare and 
promulgate the instructions for installing a 
uniform cost system for the use of its 
members. The association has wisely laid 
out a program of education the purpose of 
which is to build up within the organiza­
tions of the various members a competent 
staff which wil l facilitate the introduction 
and operation of the system. A Central 
Cost Council directed by a permanent 

salaried head, the creation of Regional Cost 
Councils, and the advisory assistance of a 
professional firm are all contemplated in 
the plan. 

The value of this sort of thing is appar­
ent. The printing industry bears evidence 
of the fact. It was among the pioneers in 
the movement. N o one who has occasion 
to pay printers' bills doubts the service 
which the cost system has rendered to the 
printing trade. Printers' prices may be 
high, but when the printers are forced to 
stand a reduction they wil l know where and 
how much they can afford to allow without 
suffering an ultimate loss. 

While the present tendency of manufac­
turers is toward association, and uniform 
systems of one kind or another are the 
natural consequence, the individual organ­
ization, whether in or out of an association, 
must give increasing thought to the matter 
of costs and their reduction. The present 
economic situation demands it as a 
matter of successful economic existence. 
The executive without accurate cost 
information is like a mariner without a 
compass. 
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