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The Expense of Borrowed Money 

ON E of the well-recognized principles 
underlying the statement of financial 

operations is that it shall show the true 
cost of goods, services, or privileges sold, 
together with the expense of conducting 
and of financing the enterprise. If a fine 
technical distinction in the use of terms 

may be made, cost usually refers to the 
product, or to physical property; expense, 
to an activity or phase of operation. Hence, 
reference is made variously to manufac­
turing cost, marketing cost, cost of prop­
erty, selling expense, administrative ex­
pense, or interest expense. Used in the 
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last sense the meaning is, expense to the 
enterprise of borrowed money or capital 
which is utilized in the conduct of the 
business. 

The expense of borrowed money com­
prehends several classes of interest. The 
classification is derived largely from the 
legal instruments on which the funds are 
borrowed. Thus, there is interest on 
bonds, debentures, notes, etc. Some in­
terest is paid as it matures; some in ad­
vance. Not all interest constitutes ex­
pense, since at times and under certain 
theories it is included in cost of goods or 
property. Frequently the charging of in­
terest to expense is deferred and the un-
absorbed portion carried as an asset in 
order to properly equalize the effect on 
operations. 

Discount was originally a term of bank­
ing origin and used to denote interest paid 
in advance. It has in more recent times 
become enlarged in its meaning and used in 
the case of bonds and similar securities to 
describe the difference between the par, 
or price at which the obligations must be 
redeemed, and some lesser price at which 
the securities were sold. It is a well-settled 
principle that this difference should be 
spread over the life of the obligations and 
thereby serve to increase the annual charge 
for interest at the agreed rate. Out of this 
practice comes the term, "effective rate." 

The expense of money, or capital bor­
rowed on obligations issued at a discount, 
is determined by the effective rate. There 
need be no mystification as to this term, 
even though it is used in connection with 
bond evaluation and so used involves com­
pound interest. Stripped of all actuarial 
technicalities, it means, when applied to 
obligations sold below par, nominal, or 
stated rate of interest, plus a pro rata share 
of the discount. Failure to include the 
discount along with the interest frequently 
would result in a misleading showing of in­

terest, the extent of which would depend on 
the margin of discount and length of time 
the obligations would have to run. The 
true rate per cent. of interest expense is 
ascertainable only when the two factors of 
interest and discount are combined. 

While the principle involved in bond 
discount is simple enough, cases which 
arise in practice sometimes have relations 
which at the start of consideration tend to 
confusion. A corporation having borrowed 
money under one mortgage on ten distinct 
issues of bonds had to deal not only with 
the question of discount, but the fact that 
some of the money was used for construc­
tion purposes. Here the expense of bor­
rowed money for a given year presented 
certain complications. The principle, 
however, should still be clear up to a cer­
tain point, and careful reasoning from that 
point on should lead to an accurate con­
clusion. 

Taking the issues one by one, determin­
ing for each the stipulated interest, adding 
thereto the proportion of discount, finding 
the effective interest for all issues, and 
applying that to the total obligation under 
the mortgage would give the composite an­
nual rate of effective interest. Thus far 
the steps presumably are clear. But before 
going further another principle must be 
recognized and adopted as a basis for 
procedure, to wit : interest on funds used 
in construction is a proper charge to cost of 
construction from the time when such 
funds are put into use incident to construc­
tion up to the point where the property is 
put into operation. This, obviously, is a 
general principle and ignores some of the 
fine points susceptible of discussion in the 
field of public utilities. The principle, 
however, is well recognized. 

Accepting, then, the principle of charg­
ing interest to construction, it follows that 
there must be complementary relief of the 
interest expense. The composite rate on 
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funds borrowed under the mortgage having 
been determined, it is a simple matter to 
apply the rate as representing the expense 
per centum, to funds used in construction, 
for the periods of time such funds were so 
employed. The effect wil l be to capitalize 
such interest, but correspondingly to re­
lieve the interest expense account and 
thereby make the interest expense account 
show as a net result the expense for money 
borrowed and used for operating or for 
funding purposes. 

The successful treatment of a case such 
as the foregoing calls for sound technical 
procedure. A basis of theory, however, is 
obviously required. A knowledge of theory 
is but a knowledge of principles. Pro­
cedure is a matter of application. The 
steps indicated in an orderly solution of an 
accounting problem are the analysis of the 

case to determine the facts; lining up the 
facts according to a classification of prin­
ciples; treating the facts as indicated by 
the principles. Sound technical procedure 
is but the application of sound principles. 

There are three outstanding principles 
which must be recognized in the above 
case: 

First, net income results should show 
the true expense of borrowed money; 

Second, where interest-bearing obliga­
tions have a discount feature the periodical 
proportion of discount must be added to the 
contractual interest; 

Third, where funds obtained through 
the medium of such obligations are used 
for construction purposes, interest corres­
ponding to such use should be capitalized 
and the expense of borrowed money re­
lieved accordingly. 
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